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AGENDA ITEM     Update on South Apron Runup reconstruction project at the Independence 
Municipal Airport.    
 
 
BACKGROUND     Bids were received on Jun 30, 2020 to reconstruct the South Apron Runup 
Area at the Independence Municipal Airport.  This is a project funded from a Kansas Airport 
Improvement Program (KAIP) grant administered by KDOT.  As noted in the Total Project 
Budget, the required KDOT share for construction ($772,740) exceeds the AV-2020-19 grant 
amount of $693,000 by $79,740.  Therefore, in order to make the project whole, additional KAIP 
funding is required along with $8,860 of additional City funding.  The highlighted section on the 
attached budget summarizes the additional funding requirements for the KDOT grant and City 
match.  We currently have a request in with KDOT to determine whether or not they will fund 
the additional cost.  Once we receive a response, we will bring this back to the Commission for 
approval to fund the additional cost to the City, or recommend other alternatives if KDOT does 
not approve the additional funds.  
         
 
SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS      

1. Bid Tab     
2. Total Project Budget for the South Apron Runup Area reconstruction project   
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Bids Received: 6/30/2020

Lochner Job No.: 000016373

Bids Tabulated By: IJW

Date: 6/30/2020

Bids Checked By: RMD

Date: 6/30/2020

I:\KAC\PRJ\000016373\PROJECT FILES\AE\ESTIMATE & BUDGET\[Master-Payitems_(IDP Runup Area).xlsm]BID TAB

Item Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. Item Description Quantity Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

BASE BID
1 1 L.S. 5,000.00$     5,000.00$           5,000.00$     5,000.00$                     50,321.33$   50,321.33$               24,200.00$          24,200.00$                  
2 150 L.F. 5.00$            750.00$              5.25$            787.50$                        5.62$            843.00$                    15.00$                 2,250.00$                    
3 1 L.S. 60,163.00$   60,163.00$         65,250.00$   65,250.00$                   68,607.00$   68,607.00$               83,000.00$          83,000.00$                  
4 1 L.S. 5,000.00$     5,000.00$           6,000.00$     6,000.00$                     22,263.95$   22,263.95$               12,000.00$          12,000.00$                  
5 6,869 S.Y. 8.00$            54,952.00$         5.50$            37,779.50$                   7.71$            52,959.99$               7.00$                   48,083.00$                  

6 1,047 L.F. 5.00$            5,235.00$           2.00$            2,094.00$                     1.57$            1,643.79$                 6.00$                   6,282.00$                    

7 418 S.Y. 10.00$          4,180.00$           7.00$            2,926.00$                     18.56$          7,758.08$                 15.00$                 6,270.00$                    
8 600 C.Y. 20.00$          12,000.00$         17.50$          10,500.00$                   69.92$          41,952.00$               35.00$                 21,000.00$                  
9 1,428 S.Y. 4.00$            5,712.00$           2.25$            3,213.00$                     2.53$            3,612.84$                 6.00$                   8,568.00$                    

10 6,878 S.Y. 8.00$            55,024.00$         13.00$          89,414.00$                   11.76$          80,885.28$               18.00$                 123,804.00$                
11 6,862 S.Y. 60.00$          411,720.00$       70.00$          480,340.00$                 49.25$          337,953.50$             56.00$                 384,272.00$                
12 1,707 S.F. 2.00$            3,414.00$           1.75$            2,987.25$                     1.92$            3,277.44$                 3.00$                   5,121.00$                    
13 2,129 S.F. 2.00$            4,258.00$           1.10$            2,341.90$                     1.12$            2,384.48$                 2.00$                   4,258.00$                    
14 2,129 S.F. 2.00$            4,258.00$           2.10$            4,470.90$                     2.25$            4,790.25$                 3.00$                   6,387.00$                    
15 2,417 S.F. 2.00$            4,834.00$           1.55$            3,746.35$                     1.72$            4,157.24$                 2.00$                   4,834.00$                    
16 1 L.S. 3,000.00$     3,000.00$           1,750.00$     1,750.00$                     2,495.17$     2,495.17$                 3,500.00$            3,500.00$                    
17 1 L.S. 1,500.00$     1,500.00$           500.00$        500.00$                        166.34$        166.34$                    3,500.00$            3,500.00$                    

Base Bid - Subtotal 641,000.00$       719,100.40$                 686,071.68$             747,329.00$                

ADD ALTERNATE NO. 1
1 1,489 C.Y. 10.00$          14,890.00$         15.00$          22,335.00$                   22.40$          33,353.60$               17.00$                 25,313.00$                  
2 6,878 S.Y. 10.00$          68,780.00$         5.50$            37,829.00$                   10.01$          68,848.78$               8.00$                   55,024.00$                  

Add Alternate No. 1 - Subtotal 83,670.00$         60,164.00$                   102,202.38$             80,337.00$                  

ADD ALTERNATE NO. 2
1 Unclassified Excavation 3,798 C.Y. 8.00$            30,384.00$         18.49$          70,225.02$               17.00$                 64,566.00$                  
2 Aggregate Subbase Course (12") 6,878 S.Y. 15.00$          103,170.00$       22.36$          153,792.08$             23.00$                 158,194.00$                

Add Alternate No. 2 - Subtotal 133,554.00$       -$                              224,017.10$             222,760.00$                

BASE BID + ADD ALTERNATE NO. 1 - TOTAL 724,670.00$       779,264.40$                 788,274.06$             827,666.00$                

BASE BID + ADD ALTERNATE NO. 2 - TOTAL 774,554.00$       910,088.78$             970,089.00$                

NO BID SUBMITTED

NO BID SUBMITTED

Dallas, TX 75234

Contractor Quality Control Program (CQCP)
Erosion Control Barrier (Silt Fence)
Mobilization (NTE 10% of Total Bid Amount)

J. Graham Construction, Inc. GCC Enterprises, Inc.
1306 S. Elm 1601 Valley View Lane

Permanent Non-Reflectorized Pavement Marking (Black)
Permanent Seeding

Engineer's Estimate

P.C.C. Pavement (6")
Aggregate Base Course (6")

Temporary Seeding

Temporary Marking, Lighting, and Barricades
Existing Pavement Removal

Saw Cut

Unsuitable Subgrade Removal and Replacement

KDOT Project No. AV-2020-20 (DESIGN)

KDOT Project No. AV-2020-19 (CONSTRUCTION)

Surface Preparation, Pavement Marking Removal
Temporary Non-Reflectorized Pavement Marking (Yellow)
Permanent Reflectorized Pavement Marking (Yellow)

Coffeyville, KS 67337

Erosion Control Blanket, Type 2C

Variable Depth Cold Milling (0" to 2")

TABULATION OF BIDS

Emery Sapp &  Sons, Inc.
140 Walnut Street

Kansas City, MO 64106

Unclassified Excavation
Treated Subgrade (12")

INDEPENDENCE MUNICIPAL AIRPORT (IDP)
INDEPENDENCE, KANSAS

BASE BID

Reconstruct South Apron Runup Area

ADD ALTERNATE NO. 1 

With 12" Treated Subgrade (ADDED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1)

ADD ALTERNATE NO. 2

With 12" Aggregate Subbase Course (ADDED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1)
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Item Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. Item Description Quantity Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

BASE BID

1 1 L.S. 58,230.00$   58,230.00$         30,000.00$   30,000.00$                   50,000.00$   50,000.00$               40,000.00$          40,000.00$                  

2 150 L.F. 3.25$            487.50$              4.00$            600.00$                        5.00$            750.00$                    5.50$                   825.00$                       

3 1 L.S. 78,337.50$   78,337.50$         30,000.00$   30,000.00$                   75,000.00$   75,000.00$               108,500.00$        108,500.00$                

4 1 L.S. 8,320.00$     8,320.00$           3,000.00$     3,000.00$                     5,800.00$     5,800.00$                 6,500.00$            6,500.00$                    

5 6,869 S.Y. 4.82$            33,108.58$         9.00$            61,821.00$                   5.00$            34,345.00$               8.50$                   58,386.50$                  

6 1,047 L.F. 4.00$            4,188.00$           6.00$            6,282.00$                     8.00$            8,376.00$                 4.00$                   4,188.00$                    

7 418 S.Y. 13.47$          5,630.46$           20.00$          8,360.00$                     12.00$          5,016.00$                 25.00$                 10,450.00$                  

8 600 C.Y. 16.40$          9,840.00$           35.00$          21,000.00$                   15.00$          9,000.00$                 75.00$                 45,000.00$                  

9 1,428 S.Y. 2.40$            3,427.20$           3.00$            4,284.00$                     2.25$            3,213.00$                 3.00$                   4,284.00$                    

10 6,878 S.Y. 8.40$            57,775.20$         12.00$          82,536.00$                   15.00$          103,170.00$             15.00$                 103,170.00$                

11 6,862 S.Y. 72.00$          494,064.00$       68.00$          466,616.00$                 83.00$          569,546.00$             80.00$                 548,960.00$                

12 1,707 S.F. 2.08$            3,550.56$           3.50$            5,974.50$                     1.71$            2,918.97$                 2.00$                   3,414.00$                    

13 2,129 S.F. 1.22$            2,597.38$           3.50$            7,451.50$                     1.00$            2,129.00$                 1.25$                   2,661.25$                    

14 2,129 S.F. 2.38$            5,067.02$           5.75$            12,241.75$                   2.00$            4,258.00$                 2.25$                   4,790.25$                    

15 2,417 S.F. 1.98$            4,785.66$           3.50$            8,459.50$                     1.53$            3,698.01$                 1.75$                   4,229.75$                    

16 1 L.S. 4,356.00$     4,356.00$           2,000.00$     2,000.00$                     1,500.00$     1,500.00$                 2,000.00$            2,000.00$                    

17 1 L.S. 4,356.00$     4,356.00$           2,000.00$     2,000.00$                     100.00$        100.00$                    110.00$               110.00$                       

Base Bid - Subtotal 778,121.06$       752,626.25$                 878,819.98$             947,468.75$                

ADD ALTERNATE NO. 1

1 1,489 C.Y. 14.20$          21,143.80$         13.00$          19,357.00$                   18.00$          26,802.00$               12.50$                 18,612.50$                  

2 6,878 S.Y. 7.20$            49,521.60$         12.50$          85,975.00$                   8.50$            58,463.00$               20.00$                 137,560.00$                

Add Alternate No. 1 - Subtotal 70,665.40$         105,332.00$                 85,265.00$               156,172.50$                

ADD ALTERNATE NO. 2

1 Unclassified Excavation 3,798 C.Y. 13.80$          52,412.40$         13.00$          49,374.00$                   

2 Aggregate Subbase Course (12") 6,878 S.Y. 13.72$          94,366.16$         20.50$          140,999.00$                 

Add Alternate No. 2 - Subtotal 146,778.56$       190,373.00$                 -$                          -$                             

BASE BID + ADD ALTERNATE NO. 1 - TOTAL 848,786.46$       857,958.25$                 964,084.98$             1,103,641.25$             

BASE BID + ADD ALTERNATE NO. 2 - TOTAL 924,899.62$       942,999.25$                 

NO BID SUBMITTED

NO BID SUBMITTED

NO BID SUBMITTED

NO BID SUBMITTED

Erosion Control Blanket, Type 2C

Contractor Quality Control Program (CQCP)

Unsuitable Subgrade Removal and Replacement

Erosion Control Barrier (Silt Fence)

Mobilization (NTE 10% of Total Bid Amount)

Temporary Marking, Lighting, and Barricades

Contech, Inc. LaForge and Budd Koss Construction Company
114 S. Elm Place 2020 North 21st Street 5830 SW Drury Lane

Broken Arrow, OK 74012 Parsons, KS 67357 Topeka, KS 66604

Temporary Seeding

Unclassified Excavation

Treated Subgrade (12")

GDS, LLC.
901 North 11th Street
St. Joseph, MO 64501

Surface Preparation, Pavement Marking Removal

Temporary Non-Reflectorized Pavement Marking (Yellow)

Permanent Reflectorized Pavement Marking (Yellow)

Permanent Non-Reflectorized Pavement Marking (Black)

Permanent Seeding

Existing Pavement Removal

Saw Cut

Variable Depth Cold Milling (0" to 2")

Aggregate Base Course (6")

P.C.C. Pavement (6")
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I:\KAC\PRJ\000016373\PROJECT FILES\AE\ESTIMATE & BUDGET\[Master-Payitems_(IDP Runup Area).xlsm]BUDGET (AA1 WITH LOW BID)

KDOT Grant AV-2020-20 - Design (95%) 28,500$           
Local Matching Funds for Grant AV-2020-20 - Design (5%) 1,500$             

Total Grant-20 30,000$           

KDOT Grant AV-2020-19 - Construction (90%) 693,000$         
Local Matching Funds for Grant AV-2020-19 - Construction (10%) 77,000$           

Total Grant-19 770,000$         

Proposed Grant AV-2020-19 Amendment for Additional Funding (90%) 79,740$           
Proposed Additional Local Matching Funds (10%) 8,860$             

---------> Total Additional Funding 88,600$           

TOTAL PROJECT FUNDING 888,600$         

Local Cost KDOT Cost Total Cost
( 5% ) ( 95% )

Engineering
Design - Basic Services 1,500.00$            28,500.00$               30,000.00$        

Subtotal 1,500.00$            28,500.00$               30,000.00$        

TOTAL DESIGN COSTS - KDOT GRANT 20 1,500$               28,500$                 30,000$           

Local Cost KDOT Cost Total Cost
( 10% ) ( 90% )

Administrative
Advertising (Est.) 8.60$                   77.40$                     86.00$               

Subtotal 8.60$                   77.40$                     86.00$               

Engineering
Construction Services (Est.) 7,925.00$            71,325.00$               79,250.00$        

Subtotal 7,925.00$            71,325.00$               79,250.00$        

Construction
Construction Costs - J. Graham Construction (BB + AA1) 77,926.44$          701,337.96$             779,264.40$      

Subtotal 77,926.44$          701,337.96$             779,264.40$      

TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COSTS - KDOT GRANT 19 85,860$             772,740$               858,600$         

TOTAL PROJECT COSTS (EST.) 87,360$             801,240$               888,600$         

TOTAL PROJECT BUDGET

INDEPENDENCE MUNICIPAL AIRPORT (IDP)
INDEPENDENCE, KANSAS

KDOT Project No. AV-2020-20 (DESIGN)
KDOT Project No. AV-2020-19 (CONSTRUCTION)

BASE BID

PROJECT COSTS (DESIGN) - KDOT GRANT 20

PROJECT COSTS (CONSTRUCTION) - KDOT GRANT 19

Reconstruct South Apron Runup Area

ADD ALTERNATE NO. 1 
With 12" Treated Subgrade (ADDED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1)

July 13, 2020

PROJECT FUNDING

MJACOBS
Highlight
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